

	SJ Denham	Thurston	Victory	Hoblit	Red Bluff
Price	\$ 35,744.00	\$ 36,374.00	No bid	No bid	\$ 36,381.00
Doc fees	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00			\$ 85.00
Color	\$ 536.00	\$ -			\$ -
Total	\$ 36,365.00	\$ 36,459.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 36,466.00
Tax at					
7.25%	\$ 2,636.46	\$ 2,643.28	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,643.79
Tire fee	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75			\$ 8.75
DMV fee	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00			\$ 36.00
Destination		\$ -			
Delivery					
	\$ 39,046.21	\$ 39,147.03	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39,154.54

Healdsburg	Matt Mazzei	Elk Grove	TSC motors	Cardinale
No bid	No bid	\$ 38,750.00	\$ 36,985.00	\$ 47,085.00
		\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00
		\$ -	\$ -	
\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38,835.00	\$ 37,070.00	\$ 47,170.00
\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,815.54	\$ 2,687.58	\$ 3,419.83
		\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75	\$ 8.75
		\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 36.00
		\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
\$ -	\$ -	\$ 42,195.29	\$ 40,302.33	\$ 51,134.58